
REGISTER NOW!

RESEARCH
COLLABORATION

WEEK

JAPAN-US The Japan-US Research Collaboration Week aims to 
provide a platform for Japanese and U.S. universities, 
research institutes, businesses, and financial 
institutions to cooperate in creating joint research 
projects and contributing to science and technology 
diplomacy between Japan and the US.  Additionally, it 
seeks to facilitate the social implementation of 
science and technology research results through 
business. This cooperation will result in societal and 
economic growth that is centered around human 
needs, sustainable, healthy, and equitable.

We welcome stakeholders who are currently engaged 
in collaborations or who wish to establish new 
collaborations in the future to discuss how to develop 
collaborations, identify potential collaborators, and 
learn from the experience of existing collaborative 
activities. This will provide insight into the "research 
highway" that is being developed as a mechanism to 
accelerate research collaboration between Japan 
and the US, and to link research results to social 
implementation and commercialization.

ABOUT THE SYMPOSIUM

CREATING  THE
JAPAN-US
RESEARCH  HIGHWAY

JULY 29 (MON)  -  JULY 31 (WED)

PROGRAM AVAILABLE HERE

F O R M A T
In Person
V E N U E
Stanford University, Li Ka Shing Center for Learning 
(291 Campus Drive, Stanford, CA) and others (TBD) 
LANGUAGE
English

R E G I S T R A T I O N  
Free. 
https://form2.jst.go.jp/s/820a1603/o

REGISTRATION DEADLINE: 

JULY 22
DON'T MISS IT!

H O S T E D  B Y

https://form2.jst.go.jp/s/820a1603/o
https://www.jst.go.jp/inter/washington/stanford2024/docs/program.pdf
https://form2.jst.go.jp/s/820a1603/o



